Page 1 of 1

NEX i)
R.K. Jain’s AN URE _.;D

v GST-ExCus

Electronic Library for GST, Customs, Excise, EXIM, FEMA & Allied Laws

Notification: 79/2022-Cus. (N.T.) dated 15-Sep-2022

Electronic Duty Credit Ledger Regulations, 2021 — Amendment of 2022

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 51B read with section 157 of the Customs Act, 1962 (52 of 1962), the
Central Board of Indirect Taxes and Customs, hereby makes the following regulations to amend the Electronic Duty Credit
Ledger Regulations, 2021, namely :-

1. Short title and commencement. — (1) These regulations may be called the Electronic Duty Credit Ledger
{Amendment) Regulations, 2022.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Electronic Duty Credit Ledger Regulations, 2021

(i} inregulation 6, in sub-regulation (2), for the words “one year”, the words “two years”, shall be substituted;

(i} in regulation 7, in sub-regulation (3), for the words “one year”, the words “two years”, shall be substituted.

Printed using R.K. Jain's EXCUS. Copyright © R.K.Jain

file:///C:/Program%20Files%20(x86)/GST-ExCus/PRINT HTM?v=2023061707221865 17-06-2023



